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ABSTRACT
The number of smart objects in our everyday life is steadily
increasing. In this workshop we discuss how the interaction
with these smart objects should be designed from various
perspectives.
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INTERACTING WITH SMART OBJECTS
There is an undeniable ongoing trend to put computing ca-
pabilities into everyday objects, turning them into smart ob-
jects [3]. Well known examples range from smart kitchen
appliances and objects (smart coffee machines, smart knifes
and cuttings boards) [6, 4, 5] up to smart meeting rooms [2]
and even city-wide infrastructures [1].

These smart objects are fully functional on their own, but
added value is obtained through communication and distributed
reasoning. While other venues have focused on the many
technical challenges of implementing smart objects, far less
research has been done on the topic of how the intelligence
situated in these smart objects can be applied to improve
their interaction with the users. This field of study poses
unique challenges and opportunities for designing smart in-
teraction.

Smart objects typically have only very limited interaction ca-
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pabilities. Yet, their behavior exhibits an amazing amount of
intelligence. For example, several digital cameras are able
to recognize faces in a scene automatically and adjust the
focus accordingly. For first time users this can be quite sur-
prising, and for experts this is a feature they probably want
to turn off. The challenge is to design intuitive interaction
with smart objects in a way the user feels in control of the
smart object and understands the behaviour and capabilities
of the object.

Interaction with smart objects is situated in the physical en-
vironment of the user, i.e., it does not take necessarily place
in a desktop setting. A smart object often uses additional
cues from its context to improve the interaction with the user,
thereby, making the interaction between user and smart ob-
ject feel more natural. Furthermore, a smart object is a phys-
ical object which allows to exploit approaches from tangible
and embodied interaction to enhance the interaction.

WORKSHOP CONTENT
The aim of this workshop is to leverage the discussion on
the design of the interaction with smart objects. Thereby, we
bring together researchers from all related fields like human-
computer interaction, ubiquitouscomputing and psychology.
We are mostly interested in how intelligent interaction tech-
niques can be combined with the specific characteristics of
smart objects, i.e., we aim to cover:

• novel interaction concepts for smart objects

• self-explanatory smart objects

• multimodal and adapted interaction

• context-awareness

• embodied and tangible interaction

• intelligibility of smart objects

• user studies and evaluation techniques

• technology and models required for enabling the interac-
tion with smart objects
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More information about the papers and outcome of the work-
shop can be found on the corresponding website
http://www.smart-objects.org.
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